
Plan of Legislative Tasks of the MF SR for 2017 
 

 
 
No. 

 
 
Name 
 
of the 
task 

 
 
Responsible 

 
 
Cooperation 

Deadline for submission 
 
Management 

meeting of 
the MF SR 

Government 
of the SR 
(deadline 
according 
to the Plan 

of 
Legislative 

Tasks of the 
Government 

of the SR 
for 2017) 

1 Draft act amending Act No. 222/2004 
Coll. on value added tax, as amended Tax and 

Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

April May 

2 Draft act amending Act No. 98/2004 
Coll. on excise duty on mineral oil, as 
amended 

Tax and 
Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

April May 

3 Draft act amending Act No. 106/2004 
Coll. on excise duty on tobacco 
products, as amended 

Tax and 
Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

April  
May 

 
4 

Draft act amending Act No. 563/2009 
Coll. on tax administration (Tax 
Procedure Code) and on the 
amendment to certain acts, as 
amended 

 
Tax and 
Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

 
April 

 
May 

 
5 

Draft act amending Act No. 199/2004 
Coll., the Customs Act, and on the 
amendment to certain acts, as 
amended 

 
Tax and 
Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

 
April 

 
May 

 
6 

Draft act amending Act No. 186/2009 
Coll. on financial intermediation and 
financial counselling and on the 
amendment to certain acts, as 
amended 

 
Financial 
Market 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

 
April 

 
May 

 
7 

Draft act amending Act No. 492/2009 
Coll. on payment services and on the 
amendment to certain acts, as 
amended 

Financial 
Market 
Section, 
NBS 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

 
June 

 
July 

 
 
8 

Draft act amending Act No. 289/2008 
Coll. on the use of electronic cash 
registers and on the amendment to Act 
of the Slovak National Council No. 
511/1992 Coll. on administration of 

 
 
Tax and 
Customs 
Section 

 
Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 

 
 

July 

 
 

August 



taxes and fees and on changes in the 
system of territorial financial 
authorities, as amended, as amended 

Section 

9 Draft act amending Act No. 595/2003 
Coll. on income tax, as amended Tax and 

Customs 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

July August 

10 Draft State Budget Act for 2018 Budget Policy 
Section 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

September October 

 
11 

Draft act amending Act No. 483/2001 
Coll. on banks and on the amendment 
to certain acts, as amended, and 
amending certain acts  

Financial 
Market 
Section, 
NBS 

Legislation 
and 
Property 
Law 
Section 

 
October 

 
November 
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